THE CODE OF CRIMINAL PROCEDURE (AMENDMENT)

ACT,2005

.' ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS

" SECTIONS'

.1

© o N e AW

U * € SR T T T T R S R T S T T

Short titles and comméncemfent. =

" Amendment of section 20.

Amendment of section 24,

Insertion of niew section 25A.
Amendment of section 29.
Amendment of section 46.
Insertion of new 'secti(')nVSOA.

Amendment of section 53.

Insertion of new section 53A.

A_méndment of section 54,

. Insertion of new section 54A. o
. Amendment of section 82.

.- Amendment of section 102.

. Amendment of section 110.’

. Amendment of section 122.

. Insertion of new segtioh 144A.

. -Insertion of new section 164A.

. Amendment of sécﬁon 176.

. Amendment of section 202;

. Amendment of secﬁon 206.

'21. Amendment of section 223,

. Am¢ndmeﬁt of section 228. o

] Am_éndrr@en’t‘ of section 260.

- Insertion of new section 291A. -
: Ame,ndrnent of section 292. -

. _Amgnd_ment of secﬂon'2:93;

. Insertion of new section 31 1A.
.~ Amendment of sectibn}_ 320.

. .Arﬁendrnent of section 356.

. Amendment of section 358.

. Amendment of _s;ecfiori 377.

. Amendient of éect_ion 378.

. Amendment of section 389.

817




818 .

SECTIONS
- 34
35,

37.
38.
39.
40,
4
.42,
43,
44,

.. Arrangement of Sections

Amsndment of section 428,

Amendmentof seetion436, .
. Insertion of new section 436A. .

Axﬁendxneﬂt of section 437.

Amendmentofsection438 R
Insertion of new section 441A. - -
Amendment of section 446. - k

‘Amendment of section 459,
Amendment of the 1Fi:stf*Schédule.

‘Amendment of the Second Schedule.

Amendment of Act 45 of 1860.




2 of 1974,

THE CODE OF CRIMINAL PROCEDURE (AMENDMENT)
' ACT 2005

No. 25 or 2005

 [23rd June, 2005]

An Act further to aniend the Code of Crimmal~'PrOCedure 1973.

BE 1t enacted by Parhament in the F1fty-s1xth Year of the Republrc of India as
follows:— ', o ,

- Act, 2005,

®) Save as otherw1se provrded in this Act it shall come into force on such date as the

Central Govemment may, by notrﬂcatlon m the Oﬂ'lcral Gazette appomt

2. In section 20 of the Code of Cnmmal Procedure, 1973 (hereinafter referred to as
the principal Act) after sub sectlon (4), the followmg sub sectlon shall be inserted,

‘ namely—— L

"(44) The State Govemment may, by general or special order. and subject to
such control and directions as it may deem fit to 1mpose delegate its powers under
sub~sect10n (4) to the Drstnct Maglstrate "

3. In sect10n 24 of the prmcrpal Act, in'sub-section (6) after the proviso, the: followmg

Explanation shall be inserted and shallbe deemed to have been mserted w1th eﬁ'ect from the
18th day of December, 1978, namely —

o ’Explamztzon ——For the purposes of thxs Sub sectlon,

(a) “regular Cadre of Prosecuting Oﬁ'lcers means a Cadre of Prosecutmg Officers
‘which includes therein the post of a Public Prosecutor, by whatever name called, and

which provides for promotion of. Ass18tant Public Prosecutors by whatever name called
. to that post S

b) "Prosecutiug Officer" means a person, by whatever name called, akpypoyinted
.. to perform the functions of a Public Prosecutor, an Additional Public Prosecutor or an-
- Assistant Public Prosecutor under this Code.'. . .

819

1. (1) This Act' may be called the Code of Cnmmal Procedure. (Amendment)

Short title and

commence-
ment.

Amendment of
. section 20.

. Amendment of
section 24,

H
;
|
i




820 : Code of Criminal Procedure (Amendment) ~ {AcT25

~ Insertion of  4.In Ghapter 11 of the principal Act, after section 25, the followmg section shali be

new section. inserted, namely:—

25A :

Dxrectoraw of o "25A. (I) The State Government may establish a Directorate of Prosecution

Prosecution. - consisting of a Director of Prosecutlon and as many Deputy Dlrectors of Prosecutron
- as it thinks fit. St : o : '

(2) A person shall be eligible to be appointed as a Director of Prosecution or a
Deputy Director of Prosecution; only if he has been in practice as an advocate fornot -
less than ten years and such appomtment shall be made wrth the concurrence of the
Chief Justrce of the High Court ‘ :

‘ 3 The Head of the Drrectorate of Prosecutlon shall be the Director of
" Prosecution, who shall function under the administrative control of the Head of the
Home Department in the State.

(4) Every Deputy Director of Prosecutron shall be subordinate to the Drrector of
Prosecutron : L

e o &), Every Public Prosecutor, Addmonal Public Prosecutor and Specral Public
* Prosecutor appointed by the State Govemnment under sub-section (1 ), or as the case

~ may be, sub-section (8), of section 24 to conduct cases in the Hrgh Court shall be
subordrnate to the Drrector of Prosecutron

(6) Every Public Prosecutor, Addmonal Public Prosecutor and Specxal Public , .
Pr&:secutor appomted by the State Government under sub-section (3), or as the case
may be, sub- -section (8), of section 24 to conduct cases in sttnct Courts and every
Assistant Public Prosecutor appomted under sub-section (1) of sectron 25 shall he -
subordmate 1o the Deputy Dlrector of Prosecutron S

L I (7) The. powers and funcnons of the Director of Prosecutlon and the Deputy
o 'Directors of Prosecution and the areas for which each of the Deputy Directors of -
. Prosecution have been appomted shall be. such as the State ‘Government may, by
: notrﬁcatron specrfy : T O T PR Y

( 8) The provisions of thxs sectron shall not apply to the Advocate General forthe
State whrle perfonmng the functions of a Public Prosecutor S

Amendmentof 5. In section 29 of the prmcrpal Act —

seetion 29. ] )

' (a) in sub-section (2), for the words "ﬁve thousand rupees" the words "ten
thousand rupees" shall be substrtuted R

R (b) in sub-sectron (3) for the words "one thousand rupees" the Words "ﬁve
- tho“_ and rupees" shall be subshtuted :

, Amam;} of 6. In section 46 of the principal Act, aﬁer sub-sectron (3) the following sub-sectron . |
section 46. - shallbemserted,namely-— L T S

I - |

"4 Save in exceptronal crrcumstances, no woman shall be arrested after sunset
and before sunrise, and where such exceptional circumstances exist, the woman pohce’

- officer shall, by making a written report, obtain the prior permission. of the Judicia

- Magistrate of the first class within whose local jurisdiction the oﬁ'ence is comrmtted »
or the arrest isto be made "




< 102 of 1956.

oF 2005]

"":.:'followmg partlculars namely RN

Code of Crimin‘al-P_mcedum (Amendment) ' 821

« T After section 50 of the prmcrpal Act, the followmg section shall 'be mserted,

- namely:—

"50A. (1) Every polrce ofﬁccr or other person makmg any arrest under this

‘Code shall forthwith give the information regarding such arrest and place where the

arrested person is being held to any of his friends, relatives or such other persons as

* may be disclosed or nominated by the arrested person for the purpose of gwmg such

mfomratlon

(2) The polrce ofﬁcer shall inform the arrested person of hls nghts under sub-

- section (/) as soon as he is brought to the pohce station,

(3)An entry of the fact as to who has been mformed of the arrest of such person

‘shall be made i ina book to be kept in the pohce statxon in such form as mey be prescnbed ,

in this behalf by the State Goveriment,

" (4) It shall be the duty of the Magrstrate before whorm such arrested person is
produced 16 safisfy himself that the requirements of sub-section (2)’ and sub sectron
(3) have been corriplied with in réspect of such arrested person.". '

« 8. In section 53 of the principal Act, for the Explanaaon the following Explanatton
shall be substituted, namely —

»-.'Explanatton —-In this sgction and in sections 53A and 54,—

- (@) "examnination" shall include the examination of blood; blood stams

" semedt, swabs in case of sexual offences, sputurn and sweat, hair samples and

-finger nail clippings by the use of moder and scientific techniques’ including

DNA ‘profiling and such other tests which the registered medical practltloner
thmks necessary it a particular case; ,

) "reglstered medical practitioner" means a medical practrtroner who

. possesses any medical qualification as defined in clause (k) of section 2 of the

: '_ "Indxan Medical Coum:rl Act, 1956 and whose name has been entered ina State
o Medrcal Regrster' o :

-9, After sectron 53. of the prmcrpal Act :the foﬂowmg sectlon shall be. mserted

namely—;_ .

“"53A. (1) When a person is amrested on a. chaige of comumitting an offence of

“'rape or an attempt to comunit rape and there are  reasonable grounds for believing that

an examination of his person will afford evidence as to the conmission of such‘offence,
it shall be lawfusl for a registered medical practitioner employed in a hospital run by
the Government or by a local authority and in the absence of such a practitioner within

. the radius of sixteen kilometres from the place where the offence has been committed,

by any.other registered medical practitioner, acting at the request of a police. officer

. ~-notbelow the rank of a sub-inspector, and for any person acting in good faith in his aid
and under his direction; to. make such an.examination of the arrested person and to use
- such force asis reasonably necessary for that purpose.

(2) The reglstered medical practltroner conductmg such exammatron shail,

Insertion of

‘new section

504..

Obligation of
person making
arrest to inform
about the
arrest, efc., to &
nominated
person.

Amendment of

- seetion 83, . ..

Insertion of
new section

S3A. -

Examination of
person accused
of rape by
medical )
practitioner. |

without delay, examine such person and prepare a report of hrs exammahon glvmg the

(t) t,he name and address of the accused and of the person by whom he was
brought ' :

- (i) the age of the accused

“(jid) mrKs of injury, if any, on the person of the accused,




82 _ Code of Criminal Procedure (Ar}nendmem)' o bazs

i‘ (zv) the descrrptron of material taken from the ‘person of the accused for
DNA profiling, and :
(y) other material particulars in reasonable detail.

(3) The“‘repdﬁ”éiiau 'state prec\iSely;the rea?SOns;for eech‘ kconcius'iou arrived at.

) The exact time of commencement and completron of the exarrnnatron shall

also be noted in the report.

(5) The registered medical pmctrtroner shall wrthout delay, forward the report

" to the investigating officer, who shall forward it to the Magistrate referred to in section
173 as’ pa,rt of the documents referred to in clause (a) of sub-section (5) of that section.".

© Amendmentof 10.,; ectlon 54 of the prmcipal Act shail be renumbered as sub sectlon (1) thereof, and

section 54. after sub-section (7) as so renumbered, the foliowmg sub-sectron shall be mserted, namely —

, "(2) Where an exammatron i$ made under sub-section (1 ), a copy of the report
. .of such ‘examination shall be furnished by the registered medrcal practttroner to the
arrested person or the person nominated by such arrested person.”, ,

. Isertionof - 11, After section 54 of the prmcrpal Act, the. followmg sectron shail be. mserted
© new section - namely S ‘ ) ) L
54A.. I .
Tdentification - -~ "54A Where a person is érrested on a charge of. cormmttmg an offence and his
:frlc’:t’:;’“ . identification by any other person or persons is considered necessary for the purpose

- of investigation of such offe
..., the officer in charge of 3 polic
... to identification by any person or persons in such manner as the Court may deem fit.".

the Court, having jurisdiction may, on the request of

Amendment of 12.In secuon 82 of the prmcrpal Act after sub-sectron ( 3‘), the followmg sub«sectlons

section 82. shall be mserted narriely — r :
. “(4) Where a proelamatron publtshed under sub-sectlon (1 ) is: m respect ofa

' person accused of an offence pumshable under section 302, 304 364, 367, 382,392,
393,394, 395, 396, 397, 398, 399,400, 402, 436, 449, 459 or 460 of the Indian Penal
" Code; and'such person fails to appear at the specified place and time required by the
proclamation, the Court may, after making such inquiry as it thinks fit, pronounce him
a proclaimed offender and make a declaration to that effect.

(%) The provisions of sub-sections (2) and (3) shall apply to a declaration made

,tatron, direct the person so arrested to subject himself

45 of 1860.

e bythe Court under sub-sectlon (4) as they apply to the proclamatron pubhshed u.nder '

'\ . sub-section (/).".

Amendmient of 113 Insectron 102 of the prmcrpal Act,— k
section 102. N )

) “"'fwhere there is difficulty in securing proper ‘accommodation for the custody of such
- ‘property, or where th¢ continued retention of the.property in police custody" may not
' be consrdered necessary’ for the purpose ‘of mvestlgatlon" shall be mserted

“(a)in pub—sectlon 3), after the words "transported to the Court" the words "or

(b) aﬂ:er sub-sectlon (3) the followmg provrso shall be added at the end, 7

"Provrded that where the property serzed under sub—sectton (1 ) is subject

B property is unknown or absent and the value of such property is less than five

~ hundred rupees, it'may forthwith be sold by auction under the orders of the

* Superintendent of Police and the provisions ‘of sectlons 457 and 458 shall, as
nearly as may be practicable, apply to the net proceeds of such sale.".

1o the possession of such




oF 2005]

_ Code ofCﬁminalfProcedum (Amendment). - 823

14 In section 110 of the prmcrpal Act, in clause (), in sub-clause (z),
(c) in item (g), the word "or shail be omrtted N
@) aﬁer item (g), the f o wmg rtem shall be mserted, namely —_
"(h) the Forergners Act 1946 or“ o

.15, In section 122 of the principal Act, in sub-sectron 0 ) in clause (b), for the words
"bond wrthout suretres" ‘the words “bond, with or without suretres,” shall be substrtuted

1 of 1946.

16, In Chapter X of the prmcrpal Act, xmder sub-headmg "C. —Urgent cases of nuisance
or apprehended danger", after section 144, the following section shall be mserted, namely —_

M44A, (I ) The Bistrict Magrsh‘ate may, whenever he consrders it necessary so

to do for the preservation of public peace or public safety or for the maintenance of

public order, by public notice or by order, prohibit in any area within the local limits

" of his:jurisdiction, the carryrng ‘of armis in any procession or the organising or holding
‘ of or takmg part in, any mass dnll or mass trarmng wrth arms in any publrc place.

(2) A pubhc notice rssued oran order made under thrs section may be directed to
“a parﬁcular person or to persons belongmg to any commumty, party or orgamsatron

(3) No publrc notice issued or an order made under this section shall remain in
’ force for more than three months from the date on whrch 1t 1s rssued or made,

(4 ) The State Govermnent may, rf 1t consrders necessary so to do for the

~ preservation of public peace or public safety or for the maintenance of public order, ™

by notification, direct that a public notice issued or order made by the District Magistrate

- under this section shall remain in force for such further period not exceeding six months

from the date on which such public notice or, order was issued or made by the District

- Magrstrate would have but for. such drrectron, exprred as it may. specrfy in the sard
" notification.

(5) The State Government may, subJect to such control and drrectrons as it may
deem fit to impose, by general or specral order delegate rts powers under sub-sectron
, (4) to the Drsmct Magrstrate RS

Explanatzon —The word "arms" shall have the meamng assrgned to rt in section
) 53AA the Indran Penal Code Lo

17 Aﬁer sectron 164 of the prrncrpal Act, the followmg sectlon shall be inserted,
namely——

45 of 1860.

h ‘164 A. (I) Where durmg the stage when an offerice of commrttmg 1ape or

attempt to commit rape is under investigation, it is proposed to get the person of the

* ‘woman with whom rape is alleged or attempted to have been committed or atiempted,
o 'exammed by a medical expert, such examination shail be conducted by a registered
" medical practitioner employed in‘a hospital nin'by the Government or a local authority
e ~and in the absence of such a practitioner, by any other registered ‘medical practitioner,
" with the consent of such woman or of a person competent to give such consent on her -
o 7behalf and such woman shall be sent to such registered medical practitioner within
twenty-four hours from the time of receiving the rnfomratron relaung to the commission

. of such offence.. ~

(2) The regrstered medrcal practrtroner, to whom such woman is sent, shall;

, ,,wrthout delay, examine her person and prepare a report of his examina ion. giving the
following partrculars, namely:— .

(i) the name and address of the woman and of the person by whom she
was brought ~

(u') the age of the >V oman,yk :

Amendment of
section 110.

Amendiment of
section 122,

Insertion of
new section
144A.
Powerto . .
prohibit
carrying arms
in procession
‘or mass drill or
mass training
with arms.

Insettioncof
neéw section

164A.

Medical

examination of

the victim of




824 ' Code of Criniinal Procedure (Améﬁdment) e fact 25

(m) the descnptlon of matenal taken fmm the person of the woman for
DNA profiling; :

(tv) marks of i mjury, 1f any, on the person of the woman
(v) general mental condmon of the woman, and '
{(vi) other material pattrculars in reasonable detail. -

(3) The report shall state precrsely the reasons for each conclusron emved at

@ The report shall specrﬁcally record that the consent of the woman or of the
* person competent to grve such consent on her behalf to such exammatlon had been
" obtained. o

o (5) The exact tlme of cor_nmencement and completron of the exammatron shall'.
" 'also be noted m the report o

(6) The regrstered medrcal practmoner shall thhout delay forward the report
- «to the mvestrgatmg officer who shall forward it to the Magrstrate referred to i insection
B 173 as part of the documents referred to in clause (a) of sub-sectron (5) of that section,

(7) Nothmg in thrs sectron shall be construed as rendermg la.wful any examination
_ without the consent of the woman or of any person competent to grve sueh congent on
her behalf

, ; Explanauon —For the purposes of thrs sectrom exammatron" and "regiStered ,
- 'medrcal practmoner" shall have the same meanmgs as in secnon 53 U
_Amendmentof ,. ;',18 Insectron 176 of the pr.mcrpal Act— SR ‘

secﬁon 17‘_5’ (i) in'sub-section (1), the words "where any person dres wlule in the custody of

“the polrce or" shall be omitted; - . T
(u) after sub-section (D), the followmg sub- sectron shall be mserted, namely —
’ "(IA) Where, - S

o (a) any person dres or drsappears, or o Lo

(b) rape is alleged fo have been commrtted on any woman
while such’ person ‘or. woman i in the custody of the. .police or in any other
custody authonsed by the Magistrate or. the Court, under thrs Code in-addition
to the inquiry or mvestlgatron held by the police, an mqurry shall be held by the

 Judicial Magistrate or the Metropolitan Magistrate, as the case may be, wrthm
whose local jurisdiction the offence has been committed."; :

:r,:sub—scctron (4) before the Explanatton the follqwmg sub section shalt

N ;forward the body wrth aview to 1ts bemg exammed to the nearest, erl Surgeon
* OF other qualrﬁed medrcal person appomted in ktl:us behalf. by the State

Amendment of
section 202.

he exercrses his Junsdretron, .

Amendmentof . ‘20.Tn section 206 of the principal Act, in sub-séction (1), '
section 206.

() in the OPCng paragraph, after the words and fi ure
the words and figures "or section 261" shall be’ mserted

, under section 260",




. or2005] 'Cadé'ofCrimiewPrwfedm (A#t‘ertdmen,t) T gs

(b) in the proviso, for the words "one hundred mpees" the words "one thousand';‘ e

. mpees“ shall be substituted.

21.In section 223 of the prmcrpal Act, in the prdviso,

(a) for the word "Magxstrate" the words "Magrstrate or Court of Sessron" shall

beSubstltuted ‘ e

Amendment of
section 223.

~ (b) for the words "lf he is satisfied"; the words g he Ot it is satlsﬁed" shall be

substltuted

- 22 In sectron 228 of the prmctpal Act m sub-sectton (1), in clause (a), for the wordsz
" and thereupon the Chief Judicial Magistrate”, the words "or any other Judicial Magistrate ;

Amendiment of

~scction 228.

-of the first class and direct the accused to appear before the Chief Judicial Magistrate, or, as. o

- the case may be, the Judicial Magistrate of the fust class on such date as he deems fit, and
'thereupon such Maglstrate" shall be substttuted o :

23 In sectlon 260 of the pnncl_ v l,Aet m sub-sectlon (1) e - k; g

. Amendment of

seetion 260

@) for the’ words "two hundred mpees" wherever they oecur the words "tWO S

thousa.nd rupees" shall be substltuted

(b) in clause (w) for the words "cnnnnal mmmdatton" the words "criminal
mtmudatton pumshable wrth unprrsonment for a term whreh may extend to two yeaxs
or w1th ﬁne or w1th both" shall be substttuted
24, After sectron 291 of the prmctpal Act the followzng sectxon shall be mserted

ely— ' S R ~ i :

o "291A (1) Any document purportmg to(' ra 1ep rt of enttf atlon under the

quir; trlal or other procéedmg
- Maglstrate 18 not called asa wrmess

B lnsemon of
5 hRw-seetion
CRNA,

-léentiﬁt:ation
wportof

. Magistrate.

Provrded that where such report contains a statement of any suspect or witness
: .+ - . o which the provisions of section 21, section 32, section 33, section 155 or section - -
1.0f 1872. 157, as the case may be, of the Indian Evidence Act, 1872, apply; such statement shall *~*
o * not be used under this sub-section except in sceordance with the provrsrons ofthose =~ . .

sechons B ’
(2) The Court may, 1f it thinks ﬁt, and shall on the appllcatton of the prosecutron
or of the accused, summon and examine such Magistxate asto the subject matter of the
) saldrepoﬂ" e et R T

B 2 25, In sectton 292 of the prmcrpal Aet,— 8

o (a) in sub—sectron (1), after the words "the Mmt" the words. "or of the Currency g
'Note Press or of the Bank Note Press Or of the Secunty Pnntmg Press shall be inserted; -

(b) in sub-s,ectlon (3), for the words "the Master of the Mm

Amendment of

section 292.

thelndlasecul‘lty - - ?‘

Press" 'the words "the General Manager of the Mint or of the Curréncy Note Press or -

B of the Bank Nate Press orof the Sec
: hall be substltuted '

ity Printing Press or of the India Security Press” -




Amendmernitof = -

section 293.

Insértjon of
new section
. 31A.

“Power of

. ordeg person to_

. give specimen

signatures or ~

handwriting.

Amen:dment'{of

section 320.

_ Amendment of

section-356.

Amendment of'

section 358. -

Arnendment of

- section 377.

Amendment of
section 378." - - N

Code of Criminal Pméedur'e(A‘tnendment) o iAC’lf 25

26. In section 293 of the principal Act, in sub-section (9~
(a) for clause (b), the following clause shall be substrtuted namely:—
"(b) the Chief Controller of Explosrves o ~
(b) after clause (), the followmg clause shall be added, namely —_

. "(g) any other Government screntrﬁc expert specrﬁed by notlﬁcatron by.
the Central Government for this purpose.". ‘ .

27 After section 311 of the prmcrpal Act, the followmg section shall be inserted,

“311A. If 2 Magistrate of the first class is satisfied that, for the purposes of any

- ivestigation or proceeding under this Code, it is’ expedrent to-direct any person,

- including an accused person, to give specimen signatures or handwriting, he may make
-an order to that effect and in that case the person to whom the order relates shall be
_produced or shall attend at the time and place specrﬁed in’ such order and shall give his
specimen signatures or handwriting: LT - :

) - Provided that no order shall be made under this section unless the person has at
some time been arrested in connection wrth such mvestrgatlon or proceeding.". -,

....28.Ins sectron 320.of the prmcrpal Act, in the Table under. sub-sectron (2) _—

(a) the words "Voluntarily causing hurt by dangerous weapons or means" in

i column 1 and the entnes relatmg thereto in columns 2 and 3 shall be omitted,;

(b) in column 3 for the word "Dltto" 'agalnst the entry relatmg to section 325,

Rk the words “The | person to whom the hurt i is caused" shall be substltuted

(c) in column 1, for the words "two hundred and ﬁﬂy rupees" wherever theyk

occur, the words "two thousand  rupees” shall be substituted.
29.In section 356 of the prmcrpal Act, in sub-sectron (1),
(@) aﬁer the words ﬁgures and letter "or section 489D", the words, figures-and

o brackets "or section 506 (in so far as it relates to cnmmal mtumdatron punishable
o w1th rmpnsonment for a a term whlch may extend to seven years or w1th fme or with
““both)" shall be inserted; ~

() after the word and ﬁgures "Chaptcr XII" the words and ﬁgures “or Chapter

, XVI“ shall be inserted..

- 30. In section 358 of the prmcrpal Act, in sub~sectlons (1 ) and (2) for the words “one
hundred rupees”, the words "one thousand rupees" shall be substltuted

31.In sectlon 377 ofthe PﬂnClpal Act i

(@) in sub-sections (/) and (2), for the words "an appeal to the Hrgh Court against k
. . the, sentence on the ground of its madequacy" the. followmg shall be substrtuted '
~knamely—-,_,k.,,: L e . R

"an appeal against the sentence on the ground of its madequacy— :

(o) to the Court of Sesslon, if" the sentence is passed by the Magistrate; and -

b) to the Hrgh Court if the sentence is passed by any other Court";

4 (b) m sub-sectlon (3) for the words "the Htgh Court" the words "the Court of -
o Sessron or, as'the case may be, the High Court" shall be substltuted

32, In section 378 of the principal Act,—. -

(z) for sub-sectlon (1 ) the followmg sub-sectron shall be substltuted namely:—

‘ "(1 ) Save : as otherwrse provrded m sub-sectron (2)
provisions of sub-sections (3) and (5),—

subject to the




 0F 2005] - dee’beriMiﬁaI Procedure (Anrendmem) | 827

(@) the Dlstrxct Magrstrate may, in any ‘case, d1rect the Publlc |

Prosecutor to present an appeal to the Court of Session from an order of e

: .acqunttal passed by a Maglstrate in respect ofa cogmzable and non—ballable
_,';oi‘fence, e ;

State Govemment may, in any case, du'ect the Public
z esent an appeal : ,the Hrgh Courtrfromk an ongmal or

Court {not bemg an order under &clause (@) or: a.n order of acqurttal passed 7

e by the Court of Sessron in revision.";

(u‘) in sub sectlon (2) for the portron begmmng w1th the words "the Central
Government may" and ending with the. words "the order of acqulttal“ the followmg
shall be subst\tuted, namely — ,

"the Central Govemment may, subJect to the provrsnons of sub-sectron (3), also
d1rect the Pubhc Prosecutor to present an appeal—— ; , V

“(a) to the Court of Sessron from an order of acquittal passed by a’

Maglstrate in respect of a cogmzable and non-ballable offence

(b) to the High Court from an ongmal or appellate order of an
cqulttal passed by any Court other than a High Court [not bemg an order

under clause (a)] or an order of acquittal passed by the Court of Session in
revision”; N .

1

(m) in sub sectlon (3) for the words "No appeal" the words "No appeal to the -

ngh Court" shall'be substrtuted

“ 33.Insection 389 of the pnnclpal Act,to sub-sectron ( ) the followmg provisos shall
be added namely — ) , ;

Amendment of -
section 389.

* "Provided that the Appellate Court shall, before releasmg onbail or on hisown

" bonda convicted -person who s’ ‘convicted of an’ offence punishable with death or

“nnpnsonment for life'or nnpnsonment fora term of not less than ten years, shall give

-opportunity to the Publlc Prosecutor for showmg causein wntmg agamst such release

Provrded further that in cases where a convncted person is released on bail it

34.7o section 428 of the principal Act, the following proviso shallbe added, namely:——

, .-"Provided that in cases. referred to in section 433A, such period of detentlon
Vshall be set off against the penod of fourteen years referred to in that sectron ",

7+ 38.In section 436 of the pnﬂcrpal Act in sub-sectlon N—
L' (a) in the ﬁrst provrso for the words may, mstead of takmg bail", the words
“may, and shall, if such person is indigent and is unable to furnish surety, instead of
takmg barl" shall be substltuted ' e e

(b) aﬁer the ﬁrst provxso, the followmg Eprananon shallbe inserted, namely:—

g ‘pen to the Publlc Prosecutor to ﬁle an apphcatxon for the cancellatron of the

Amendment of
section 428.

-Amendrmient of

section 436.

“Explananon —-—Where a person is unable to gnve baﬂ within a week. of

' the date of his arrest; it ‘shall be a sufficient ground for the officer or the Court to
presume that he i isan mdngent person for the purposes of this proviso.".




88 - Codeof Criminal Pra?@dﬁ??(f‘?ﬂ%ﬂdtﬂ@ﬂ”- L Jper2s

Insertion of . .36, After section 436.of the prmcrpal Act, the followmg section shall be inserted,
new section namely . . _ ’
436A. - NSRS e i N ’ . A ,
Makimum - 5'436A.-Where-aperson has,'"duﬁng the 'pe'riod'of inves‘t'igatiOn, inquiry or trial
period for . under this Code of an offence under-any law (not being ‘an offence for which the
:Vtﬂ;:l:t;:] .. punishment of death has been specified as one of the punishments under that law)
prisoner can be o undcrgone detention for a perlod extendrng up to one-half of the maximum period of
. detained. . - imprisonment specrﬁed for that offence ‘under that law, he’ shall be released by the
' v /Court on h1s personal bond w1th ot w1thout suretres L
S Provrded that the Court may, after hearing the Publrc Prosecutor and for reasons
~ to be recorded by it in writing, order the continued detention of such person for a-
_period longer than one-half of the said penod or release him on ba11 mstead of the
k 'personal bond with or w1thout suretres E -’ -k : : ;
Provided further that no such person shall in any case be detamcd durmg the
~ period of investigation, inquiry or-trial for-more’ than the. maxrmum perrod of
1mpnsonment provided for the said offence under that law.:

Explanatzon —In.computing. the period of’ detentron under this section for V
grantmg bail; the period of detention passed.due to delay in proceedmg caused by the
accused shall'be excluded.". : o : -

Amendmentof - - 37 In sectron 437 of the prmcrpal Act— o

section 437.
B ‘ (z) m sub- sectron ¢ ),

(a) in clause (u), for the words "a non-bailable and cogmzable offence”,
" ‘the words "a cogmzable offence pumshable wrth 1mpr1sonment for three years
. or more but not less than'seven years" shall be substituted;

namely —

TR "Provrded also.that no person shall, if the. offence alleged to have
... been commltted “by.him is. punlshable with death imprisonment for life, .
;or imprisonment for seven years or more, be released on bail by the Court
: - under this sub-section, w1thout grvmg an, opportumty of hcanng to the
Public Prosecutor.";

(u) 1n sub-sectron (3), for the _portron begmmng wrth the _wo ' “the Court may
' unpose" and endmg with the words "the interests of Justrce" the followmg shall be
: substrtuted, namely — :

“the Court shall i nnpose the condrtrons —

, (a) that such person shall attend in accordance wrth the conditions
~ofthe bond executed under this Chapter, :

()] that such person shall not comrmt an offence similar to the offence
of which he is accused, or. suspected of the commlssron of whrch he is
o suspected and -

(©) that such person shall riot drrectly or: 1nd1rect1y make any :
‘inducement, threat or promise to any person acquainted with the facts of
- “the'case so as to dissuade him from disclosing such facts to the Court orto
. any polrce ofﬁcer or tamper wrth the ev1dence

and may- also 1mpose in.the - mterests of Justrce such other condltrons as it
".considers necessary L :

(b) after the thlrd provrso the followrng provrso shall be niserted -




oF 2005]‘ : _codé ‘o‘f‘c‘rim;naz"p;aeeaare (Ar_‘ﬁ*end;ﬁ‘éﬁ‘t)
- 38, In section 438 of the prmclpal Act, for sub sectlon (1 ) the followmg sub- sectrons
-.shall be substltuted namely:—

“(1) Where any person} has reason to beheve that he may be arrested on accusatlon
- of having committed a non-bailable offence, he may apply to the ngh Court or the
~ Court of Session for a direction under this section that in the event of such arrest he

. shall be released on bail; and that Court may, after takmg into- cons1deratlon mter »

alic, the followmg factors, namely:— .- A
(i) the nature and gravrty of the accusatlon

(i) the antecedents of the apphcant mcludmg the factas to whether he has
previously uridergone nnpnsonment on conv1ctlon by a Court m respect of any
cogmzable offence,

(iii) the: poss1b111ty of the appllcant to ﬂee from Justlce and

(iv) where the accusation has been made w1th the object of i m_;urmg or
humiliating the applicant by having him so arrested, T

either reject the appllcatlon forthwith or issue an 1nterrm order for the grant of
v antlclpatory bail: »

Provided that; where the ngh Court or as the case may be the Court of Sessron
_ has not passed any interim order under this sub- sectlon or has re_]ected the application
" for grant of anticipatory bail; it shall be open to an officer in-charge of a police station

to arrest, without warrant the. apphcant on the basrs of the accusatlon apprehended in
‘ such application, .

‘329' i

Amendment of’
section 438.

4), Where the Court grants an interim order under sub sectlon (1) it shall ‘

B ~forthw1th cause a notice bemg not less than seven days natice, together w1th a copy of

~ such order to be served on the Public Prosecutor and the Superintendent of Police, ‘
* with a view to give the Public Prosecutor a reasonable opportumty of bemg heard'

when the application shall be finally heard by the Court B

; (1B) The presence of the applicant seeking antlclpatory bail shall be obllgatory

at the time of final hearing of the application and passing, of final order by the Court,

; if on an application made to it by the Public Prosecutor the Court cons1ders such
presence necessary in the mterest of j _]ustlce : ;

" 39, After section 441 of the pnnclpal Act, the: followmg sectron shall be mserted
namely —
"441A. Every person standing surety to an accused person for h1s release on
ball shall make a declaration before the Court as to the number of persons to whom he
has stood surety including the accused, giving therein all the relevant particulars.".

40. In"\section 446 of the,princ'ipal Act, in sub-section. (3),:for the words "at its
discretion”, the. Words "after recording its reasons for doing so" shall be substituted.

‘ ' 41 In section 459 of the prmclpal Act for the words "less than ten rupees the words
. "less than five hundred rupees” shall be substltuted

42, In the Fust Schedule to the principal Act ‘under’ the headmg "I -—OFFENCES ‘

, UNDER THE INDIAN PENAL CODE",— ;
I () after the entnes relatmg to section 1 53A the followmg entnes shall be mserted,
namely—— R R e ,
1 ; o 2 3 4 5 R
"153AA Knowingly carrying - Imprisonment' Ditto- - Ditto " AnyMagis-
arms in any procession or for 6 months . trate;

__organising or holdmg or
" taking part in any mass -
drill or mass tralmng
 witharms

~ and fine of -
2,000 rupees

Insertion of new
section 441A.

) Declaration by

sureties.

Amendment of -
section 446. = .

Amendment of
section 459.

Amendment of
the First . .

" Schedule. -




80 Code.ofcziminazppb,cedam'(Ar,r?e,m{mem) laer 25

(b} in the 6th column, in the entries relatmg to section 153B for the word "Drtto"
the words "Maglstrate of the first class" shall be substttuted,

) (c) after the entnes relatmg to Sectron 174 the followmg entnes shall be in-
o serted, namely—-— ‘

“l74A Failure to appear at specified - Impnsonment Cogmz- Non-barl-; Magistrate of -
place and specified time as k_for 3 years, or able . . able . - the firstclass.
- requrred bya proclamatlon ... withfine,or o ’
. published under sub-section (/) ~ 'withboth - .
" of section 82 ofthrs Code - = o

 Inacase where declaration has' ’Impnsonment Ditto - Ditto * - . Ditto.";
- been made under sub-section .. .-for.7 years ,' S '
(4) of section 82 of this Code ~ ~ and fine. . .
. pronouncing a person as ~ o
proclarmed offender

"‘:kf(d) mthe entnes relatmg to sectron 175—— b e L

() in the 4th column for the word "Dltto" the word "Non-cogmzable"

(u) in the 5th column for the word "Dltto" the word "Ballable" shall be
substltuted : : v :

(e) after the entnes relatmg to sectlon 229,

the followmg entnes shall be in-

,,f,sjerged,namel‘y; I S e

- ’ 1 w ”{2, i 4;:’: T - 3 4 : | 5 ’ : o 6 ‘

"229A ' Failure by person released Impnsonment for 'Cogniz- " Non-bail- Any ‘

* . on bail or bond to appear -1 year, or ﬁne, ,;abl,e‘ - wable ;- Magrstrate "
mCourt R orboth ' N R

09 in the 5th colurmn, in the entnes relatmg to— f - v

0 section 274 forthe word "Ditto", the word: "Non-barlable" shall be -
o 'substrtuted , , .

: (u) sectron 275 for the word "Dltto" ‘the word "Ballable" shall be
‘ substltuted - , S .

r (uz) seciion 324; for the word "Drtto" the word "Non-ballable“ shall be
. substltuted c : r S L

(iv) section 325 for’ the word “Dltto" the word "Ballable" shall be
substrtuted ~

(v) .ectlon 332 for the word "Ballable" ’the word "Dltto" shall be ,4
substltuted , o

(vz) sectron 333, for the word "Non-ballable" the word "Dltto" shall be
substltuted .

’ (vu) sectron 353 for the word "Dltto" the word "Non-ballable" shallbe
' ~fsubst1tuted A ol R

(vzu) Sectlon 354 for the word “Ditto", the word "Barlable" shall be r
’ :substrtuted : , .




. OF 2005] " l, ~~ Code oan'minal Prbcedure‘(Ame_ndmem)- ‘ - 831

43 In the Second Schedule to the prmcnpal Act, in Form No. 45 after the words and. Amendment of
figures "See section 436,", the figures and letter "436A," shall be inserted. S e Sevend

44 Inthe Indian Penal Code,—

Amendment of

201974, -

(a) after section 153A, the followmg seetron shall be mserted, namely —

- ‘153AA. Whoever knowingly carries arms inany processron or orgamzes
or holds or takes part in‘any mass drill or mass training with arms in any public
place in contravention of any public notice or order issued or made under section

" 144A of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 shall be punished with
imprisonment for a term which may extend to six months and wrth fine which

may extend to two thousand rupees.

Explananon —"Arms" means- -articles’ of -any .description desrgned or
adapted as weapons for offence or defence and mcludes fire arms, sharp edged
weapons, lathis, dandas and sticks.'; .

®) aﬁer section 174, the followmg sectlon shall be inserted, namely -

"174A. Whoever fails to appear at the speclﬁed place and the specrﬁed.

. time as required by a proc]amatlon published under sub-section ¢/ ) of section
- 82 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 shall be punished with imprisonment

for a term which may extend to three years or with fine or with both, and where

‘a declaration has been made under sub-section (4) of that section pronouncing
* -him as a proclaimed offender, he shall be punished with imprisonment for a
“term which may extend to seven years and shall also be liable to fine.";

“{c) after section 229, the fo]]owmg sectron shal] be mserted namely —

"229A.Whoever, having been. charged with an offence: and re]eased on.-.

bail or on bond without sureties, fails without sufficient cause (the burden of

- proving ‘which shall lie upon hiri), to appear in Court in accordance with the
terms of the bail or bond, shall be punished with imprisonment .of either
description for a term which may extend to one year, or with fine, or with both.

Explananon —The pumshment under this sectlon is—

Act 45 of 1860.

Punishment for
knowingly ..
carrying arms
in any
procession. or

organising,.or
. holding’ or

taking part in

-any mass drill

or mass training

~ with arms.

Non-~
appearance in
responseto a
proclamation
under section

-82 of Act2 of

1974. -

Failure by
person released

“on bail or bond -

to appear in
Court. -

" (a) in addition to the punishment to which the offender would be :

_ ' hable ona conviction for the offence with whlch he has been charged and

. (b) w1thout prejudrce to the power of the Court to order fcrferture of
the bcn .




	2005
	missing pages2005
	2005
	missing pages2005
	2005
	missing pages2005
	2005
	missing pages2005
	2005

